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No. BEA/TC/BD/Tenders-049

Directorate for Foreign Trade

The Union of Chambers and

Commodity Exchanges of Turkey

Ankara

To the kind attention of Mr. Senol Keskin

Subject: Announcement of the upcoming international tenders in Bangladesh.

Dear Mr. Keskin,

We would like to inform you that the Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board (BREB) and Bangladesh Chemical Industries Corporation (BCIC),
Government of Bangladesh, has floated international tenders for their requirements and now inviting companies for “Invitation for Bids”.

Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board gets loans from Asian development Bank (ADB) under the Bangladesh Power System Enhancement and
Efficiency Improvement Project for the procurement of conductor, cable, distribution transformer & sectionalizing devices.

Moreover, Bangladesh Chemical Industries Corporation (BCIC) floated international tenders for its affiliates such as Ashuganj Fertilizer &
Chemical Company Limited (AFCCL), Bangladesh Insulator & Sanitaryware Factory Ltd. BISF, and DAP Fertilizer Company Limited for the
procurement of the low tension motor, weighing controller, set ball & socket type metallic fittings, calcined bauxide, gas chlorinator,
electronic smart transmitter, alnico compound Z-3, spare parts process and condensate pump as required.

In view of the above, kindly find herewith the links for the invitations:

i) Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board (BREB)

http://www.reb.gov. men nder/22122016/IFB_271_22122016.pdf
ii) Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board (BREB)
ii) Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company Limited (AFCCL)

iv) Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company Limited (AFCCL)

We also attached herewith the copies of the aforementioned invitations for your ready reference and necessary use.

It would be deeply appreciated if you kindly arrange to disseminate the invitations among your Members as well as post it on your website
for the interested firms of Turkey to participate with their proposals.

Thanks in advance for your kind cooperation.
Kind regards

Kemal Dogan

Trade and Commercial Coordinator
Embassy of Bangladesh, Ankara
Mobile: +905307630330

Office: +903124952720

Fax: +903124952744
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Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board (BREB)
Invitation for Bids (IFB)
The People’s Republic of Bangladesh

Date: 21 December'2016

ADB Loan No.: Bangladesh Power System Enhancement and Efficiency Improvement Project.

IFB Title: Procurement of Conductor, Cable, Distribution Transformer & Sectionalizing Devices .

Package Number: URIDS (W)-G-02 & URIDS (W)-G-06.

Deadline for submission of Bids: 06.02.2017

Ref: 27.12.2637.064.07.01.16.536 Date:20.12.2016

The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board has applied financing from the Asian Development Bank (ADB) toward the cost of the
URIDS; RRKB (Up-gradation Rehabilitation and Intensification of Distribution System Rajshahi, Rangpur, Khulna and Barisal
Divisions) Project of BREB under Power Sector Enhancement and Efficiency Improvement of Bangladesh and intends to apply
part of the proceeds toward payments under the contracts for procurement of Conductor, Cable, Distribution Transformer &
Sectionalizing Devices .

2| The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board now invites sealed bids from eligible bidders. The Goods are grouped in different Packages
and Lots. Bidders have the option of submitting the Bids for one, any combination, or all of the lots. Lots shall not be further subdivideg
for bidding purposes. Goods to be delivered in designated BREB's Central Warehouse, Shiromoni, Khulna as follows:

[y

; 1. Delvery. -
IR DO PP antity > |- Schedule from
Package No BREB Item . oo Lot NoL S {Nosi/f the date of
. o AT “Sets/KM) contract
07 (Conductor, Bare) URIDS(W)-G-02-01 Conductor, Bare 17388 KM
08 (Conductor, Insulated -G-02-
(Conductor, Ins ) URIDS(W)-G-02-02 Conductor, Insulateq 17358 KM 50% of Unit of
5 11KV & 33KV Sub-Marine each Lot within
URIDS(W)-G-02 | < imarine & Underground Cable, 11KV & 33KV Under 20 weeks and
C URIDS(W)-G-02-03 Ground Power Cable, 30 KM s
able) o ) ) remaining
Termination Kits Straight 50% of each
Through Jointing Box etc. unit within 40
07 (Distribution Transformer)) | URIDS(W)-G-06-01 Distribution Transformer. 15812 NO weeks.
URIDS(W)-G-06 . . . Fuse Cutout, Fuse Barrel, Fuse
21 (Sectionalizing Device) URIDS(W)-G-06-02 Link, Surge Arrester etc, 610600 NO

3 | International competitive bidding will be conducted in accordance with ADB's Single-Stage: One-Envelope
procedure and is open to all bidders from eligible countries as described in the Bidding Document.

4 | Interested eligible bidders may obtain further information from The Project Director - (e-mail:uridsirkbbreb@gmail.com) and inspect
the bidding documents during office hours 09:00 AM to 17:00 PM (Except Friday & Saturday) at the address given below. Bidding

Document is also available at BREB's website i.e. http://www.reb.gov.bd & http://www.adb.org/countries/bangladesh/main
However the web version of the bidding document is for information purpose only.

5 | The Pre-Bid meeting shall be held at Conference Room of Chief Engineer (Project), 3™ Floor, Head Office Building,
BREB on 17-01-2017 at 11:00 hours local time (Local Time: Bangladesh).

6 | Eligibility and Qualifications requirements: Manufacturer or supplier having the following qualifications:

(i) The Bidder (in case of JV, each partner) shall demonstrate that the goods offered have been in production for at
least two years.






(if) Experiences: The Bidder shall | Package No Lot No 01 Contract Value | Liquid Asset |
at-least have  experience  of (US$ Million) (US$ Million)
supplying similar goods having value URIDS(W)-G-02-01 6.70 2.70

in one contract, within the last . e 530 7.14
three (3) years & at the time of bid URIDS(W)-G-02 | URIDS(W)-G-02-02

submission should have at least the ) URIDS(W)-G-02-03 1.30 0.53
amount of liquid asset or working URIDS(W)-G-06-01 5.60 2.20
capital or credit facility or their | URIDS(W)-G-06

combination mentioned against Lot: URIDS(W)-G-06-02 0-80 0.30

Additional details are provided in the Bidding Documents.

When comparing Bids, ADB's Domestic Preference Scheme will be applied in accordance with the provisions stipulated in |
the bidding documents. |
7 | A complete set of each bidding documents in English may be purchased by interested eligible bidders upon the
submission of a written application to the address below and upon payment of a nonrefundable fee of equivalent
US$ 50. The method of payment will be Bank Draft or Pay Order in favor of Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board,
Dhaka. For overseas delivery, the bidder may obtain the bidding document by instructing any international courier
service to collect the same from Office of the Project Director, URIDS;RRKB Project, Bangladesh Rural Electrification
Board, 6™ Floor, Head Office Building, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh.

8 | Bidding Document last selling Date on 06-02-2017 at 10:00 Hours local ime (Local Time: Bangladesh). Bids must be delivered to
the address stated at the end of this invitation on or before 06-02-2017 at 12:00 Noon local time (local Time:Bangladesh) . Electronic
bidding will not be permitted. Late bids will be rejected. Bids will be publidy opened in the presence of the bidders’ designated
representatives and anyone who chooses to attend at the Brig Gen. Sabihuddin Ahmed Hall (Auditorium), 1st floor, Head Office
Building, BREB, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh on 06-02-2017 at 12:30 Hours (Local Time: Bangladesh).

9 Package No Lot No Bid Security (US$ Million)
. . URIDS(W)-G-02-01 0.28
Al bids must be accompanied URIDS(W)-G-02 URIDS(W)-G-02-02 0.22
by a Bid Security for individual
) ] URIDS(W)-G-02-03 0.06
Lot are mentioned in the box.
URIDS(W)-G-06 URIDS(W)-G-06-01 0.22
URIDS(W)-G-06-02 0.03

In case, amount is in any currency other than USD, a selling exchange rate issued by Bangladesh Bank, 28 days prior to bid
submission shall be used. Bidders participating in multiple Lot shall submit bid security for each Lot separately.

10| The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board Will not be responsible for any cost or expenses incurred in connection with
the preparation or delivery of Bids.

Project Director, URIDS;RRKB Project,
Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board,
% Fioor, Head Office Building,
Nikunja-2, Khilkhet,

City: Dhaka-1229, Country: Bangladesh.
Tel: + 8802- 8900309

E-mail: uridsrrkbbreb@gmaii.com

Web site: www.reb.qov.bd.
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Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board (BREB)
Invitation for Bids (IFB)
The People’s Republic of Bangladesh

Date:21 December 2016
ADB Loan No.: Bangladesh Power System Enhancement and Efficiency Improvement Project.
IFB Title: Procurement of Conductor, Distribution Transformer & Sectionalizing Devices.
Package Number: URIDS(E)-G-02 & URIDS(E)-G-06.
Deadline for submission of Bids: 06.02.2017

Ref: 27.12.2637.125.31.031.197.16.529 Date: 19.12.2016

1| The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board has applied finanding from the Asian Development Bank (ADB) toward the cost of the URIDS;
DMCS (Up-gradation Rehabilitation and intensification of Distribution System Dhaka, Mymensingh, Chittagong and Sylhet Divisions)
Project of BREB under Power Sector Enhancement and Effidency Improvement of Bangladesh and intends to apply part of the proceeds
toward payments under the contracts for procurement of Conductor, Distribution Transformer & Sectionalizing Devices.

N

The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board now invites sealed bids from eligible bidders. The Goods are grouped in different Packages
and Lots. Bidders have the option of submitting the Bids for one, any combination, or all of the lots. Lots shall not be further

subdivided for bidding purposes. Goods to be delivered in designated BREB's warehouses (Dhaka, Khulna & Chittagong) as follows:
Package No BREB Item (Nos) - ‘Lot No, - |- Brief Description of Goods < Quantity - fromthedate of - -
URIDS(E)-G-02-01 ACSR, Bare Conductor 24262 KM 50% of Unit of
3 URIDS(E)-G-02-02 Insulated Conductor 17695 KM each Lot within
D! -G
URIDS(E)-G-02 19 (Conductor) URINS(E)-G-02-03 11 833 KV Underground & Submarine | 36 KM with 300 nos. kits 20 weeks and
-JTUA Cable with kits & Joning Boxes. & 150 nos. Joining Box remaining 50%
URIDS(E)-G-06 07 (Distribution Transformer) | URIDS(E)-G-06-01 | Distribution Transformer 18545 Nos. of each unit
21 (Sectionalizing Devices) | URIDS(E)-G-06-02 | Fuse Cutout & Surge Arvester; Fuse ink 1095300 Nos. +| within 40 weseks.

3 | International competitive bidding will be conducted in accordance with ADB's Sin
procedure and is open to all bidders from eligible countries as described in the Bidding Document.

gle-Stage: One-Envelope

bai

4 | Interested eligible bidders may obtain further information from The Project Director (e-mail: pdrids42breb@gmail.com) and inspect the
bidding documents during office hours 09:00 AM to 17:00 PM (Except Friday & Saturday) at the address given below. Bidding Document is
also available at BREB's website i.e. http://www.reb.gov.bd & hitp://www.adb.org/countri

ladesh/main However the web version of
the bidding document is for information purpose only.

5 | The Pre-Bid meeting shall be held at Conference Room of Chief Engineer (Project, 3rd Floor, H/Q Building),
on 17-01-2017 at 11:00 hours local time (Local Time: Bangladesh)

6 | Eligibility and Qualifications requirements: Manufacturer or supplier having the following qualifications:
(i) The Bidder (in case of JV, each partner) shall demonstrate that the goods offered have been in production for at least two years.

(i) Experiences: The Bidder shall at-least Package No Lot No 01 Contract Value Liquid Asset
have experience of supplying similar (US$ Million) (US$ Million)
goods having value in one contract, URIDS(E)-G-02-01 7.68 3.6
within the last three (3) years & at the | \Ripg(E).G-02 | URIDS(E)G-02-02 5.64 2.4
time of bid submission should have at . URIDS(E)-G-02-03 156 06
least the amount of liquid asset or = = = -
working capital or credit facility or their URIDS(E)-G-06 URIDS([E)“G"OG'OI 6.0 2.8
combination mentioned against Lot: URIDS(E)-G-06-02 | 10 0.42

Additional details are provided in the Bidding Documents.
When comparing Bids, ADB's Domeslic Preference Scheme will be applied in accordance with the provisions stipulated in the bidding documents.,

7 | A complete set of each bidding documents in English may be purchased by interested eligible bidders upon the submission of a written
application to the address below and upon payment of a nonrefundable fee of equivalent US$ 50. The method of payment will be
Bank Draft or Pay Order in favor of Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board, Dhaka. For overseas delivery, the bidder may obtain the
bidding document by instructing any intemational courier service to collect the same from Office of the Project Director, URIDS; DMCS
Project, Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board, 4™ Floor, Training Academy Building, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh.

8 | Bidding Document last selling Date on 06-02-2017 at 11:00 Hours local ime (Local Time: Bangladesh). Bids must be delivered
to the address stated at the end of this invitation on or before 06-02-2017 at 12:00 Noon (local time: Bangladesh) . Electronic
bidding will not be permitted. Late bids will be rejected. Bids will be publicly opened in the presence of the bidders’ designated
representatives and anyone who chooses to attend at the Brig Gen. Sabihuddin Ahmed Hall (Auditorium), 1st floor, Head Office
Building, BREB, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh on 06-02-2017 at 12:30 Hours (Local Time: Bangladesh).

9 Package No Lot No Bid Security (US$ Million)
) - URIDS(E)-G-02-01 0.3
Al bids must be accompanied by | yoingey 607 | URIDS(E)-G02.02 0.2
a Bid Security for individual Lot = - -
) I URIDS(E)-G-02-03 0.05
are mantioned in the box. e . e
URIDS(E)-G-06 URIDS(E)'G‘OG"O_;L._.,_ —— ___0;7;5_... R
URIDS(E)-G-06-02 0038 |
In case, amount is in any currency other than USD, a selling exchange rate issued by Bangladesh Bank, 28 days prior to bid
10| The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board Will not be responsible for any cost or expenses incurred in connection with

the preparation or delivery of Bids.

Project Director, URIDS;DMCS Project,
Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board,
4™ Floor, Training Academy Building,
Nikunja-2, Khilkhet,

City: Dhaka-1229, Country: Bangladesh.
Tel: + 8802- 8900757

E-mail: pdrids42breb@gmail.com

Web site: www.reb.gov.bd.
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Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company Limited Zﬁ§
(An Enterprise of BCIC) @%{@;&}
International Tender Notice \w
01. | Ministry / Division Ministry of Industries.
02. | Agency Bangladesh Chemical Industries Corporation (BCIC)
03. | Name of Procuring Entity Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company Limited, Ashuganj,
Brahmanbaria
04. | Invitation Ref. No., Invitation for, Bid Security Money, Last Selling Date & Time, Receiving &
Opening Date & Time as follows:
S1 Ref No. Invitation For Security Last Selling Receiving Opening Date
Money Date & Time | Date & Time | & Time
01. | AFCCL/OS-4191 | Gas Chlorinator TK. 10,000.00 16.01.2017 17/01/2017 | 17/01/2017
(Re-Tender) Upto 430 PM | upto 12PM | At3.00 PM
02. | AFCCL/OS-4226 | Electronic Smart TK. 60,000.00 29.01.2017 30/01/2017 | 30/01/2017
( Re-Tender) Transmitter Upto 4.30 PM | upto 12 PM | At 3.00 PM
05. | Procuring Method International Open Tendering Method (IOTM)
06. | Source of Fund Any suitable source of finance.
07. | Name and Addresses of the Offices 1. | Controller of Accounts, BCIC, BCIC Bhaban(6" floor), 30-31,
For of Selling Tender Documents Dilkusha C/A, Dhaka.
g 2. | Sr. GM, BCIC Branch Office, 6-Agrabad C/A, Chittagong
3. | GM (A&F), AFCCL, Ashuganj, Brahmanbaria.
4. | Deputy Commissioner (DC), Treasury Section , Brahmanbaria.
08. | Address of the office for 1. General Manager (Commercial), Ashuganj Fertilizer &
Receiving of Tenders. Chemical Company Limited (AFCCL), Ashuganj,
Brahmanbaria-3403.
2. Office of the Deputy Commissioner (DC), General Section
(2" Floor), Brahmanbaria.
3. Office of the Executive Engineer, PWD, Brahmanbaria.
09. | Opening Tender Document General Manager (Commercial), Ashuganj Fertilizer &Chemical |
Company Limited (AFCCL), Ashuganj, Brahmanbaria-3403.
| 10. | Price of Tender Documents Tk. 500.00 for each set.
11. | Detail Address of Managing Director, Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company
Official Inviting Tender Limited, Ashuganj, Brahmanbaria- 3403
Phone: PABX 08528-74231, 74355
Fax :880-8528-74211, E-mail : afcclmd@gmail.com
12. | Special Instruction 1. The Procuring Entity reserves the right to accept or reject

any or all offers without assigning any reason.

2. Ifthere is Govt. Holyday or unavoidable situation arises on
the date of tender receiving / Opening in those cases. The
next normal working day will be considered valid date for
receiving / opening of the tender at the same place and time.

‘ﬁ%ﬁl /éfaD "Lbg

Deputy General Manager ( Commercial) &
Head of Commercial Department
For Managing Director
Tel : Tel : 08528-74054
Email: nazrul.bcic.3756.4@gmail.com







Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company Limited
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(An Enterprise of BCIC)
International Tender Notice

(g,
S

E 01. | Ministry / Division | Ministry of Industries.
02. | Agency { Bangladesh Chemical Industries Corporation (BCIC)
3. Name of Procuring Entity Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company Limited. Ashuganj,
B ) Brahmanbaria S
04. | Invitation Ref. No.. Invitation for. Bid Security Money. Last Selling Date & Time, Last Receiving Date & Time.
Opening Date & Time as follows:
Sl Ref. No. Invitation For | Security Last Selling | Last Receiving | Opening
| B Money Date & Time | Date & Time | Date & Time
01 | AFCCL/OS-4231 | Alinco Compound Z-3 k. 7,000.00 | 22-01-2017 23-01-2017 23-01-2017
3 (Re-Tender) (Sealing Compound). Up to At 12.00 PM At 03.00 PM
; I _ - 04.00 PM I
f 02 | AFCCL/OS-1238 | Spare Parts for Process k. 05-02-2017 06-02-2017 06-02-2017
! Condensate Pump. 1.00.000.00 Up to At 12.00 PM At 03.00 PM
L - | 04.00 PM
| 05. | Procuring Method: _| International Open Tendering Method (10TM) I
196 Source of Fund: Any suitable source of finance. -
| 07. | Name and Addresses of the . Controller of Accounts, BCIC, BCIC Bhaban (6"l floor), 30-31. Dilkusha
“; | Offices for Selling Tender C/A, Dhaka.
| | Documents: | 2. | Sr.GM, BCIC Bramlet"ﬁce. 6-Agrabad C/A, Chittagong.
| 3. | GM(A&F), AFCCL, Ashuganj, Brahmanbaria.
5 4. | Office of the Deputy Commissioner (DC), Treasury Section, |
- Brahmanbaria. L 77}
08. | Address of the Offices I.General Manager (Commercial), Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company ‘
tor Receiving of Tenders: Limited (AFCCL), Ashuganj, Brahmanbaria-3403.
2. Office of the Deputy Commissioner (DC), General Section (2™ Floor).
Brahmanbaria
[ nen ) 7 3. Office of the Executive Engineer, PWD, Brahmanbaria. ) -
09. | Opening Tender Documents: General Manager (Cominercial), Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company
] | Limited (AFCCL), Ashuganj, Brahmanbaria-3403.
10, | Price of Tender Documents: I'k. 500.00 for each set. -
} IT. | Detail Address of Managing Director. Ashuganj Fertilizer & Chemical Company Limited,
| Ofticial Inviting Tender: Ashuganj, Brahmanbaria- 3403 ;
| ; Phone: PABX 08528-74231. 74355, Fax : 880-8528-74211, ‘
L o S | E-mail : afcclmd@gmail.com R
12, | Special Instructions : 01.The Procuring Entity reserves the right to accept or reject any or all ofters

without assigning any reason.

02. If there is Govt. Holiday or unavoidable situation arises on the date of tender
receiving/Opening in those cases. |he next normal working day will be f
considered valid date for receiving/opening of the tender at the same place T
_and time. [

(Mi. Nzu:ul 1411)

Deputy General Manager (Commercial) &
Head of Commercial Department
For Managing Director
Tel: 08528-71054

E-mail: nazrul beie 3756 44 gmail com







BANGLADESH INSULATOR & SANITARYWARE FACTORY LTD.
(An Enterprise of BCIC)

. INVITATION FOR INTERNATIONAL OPEN TENDER (GOODS) ::

01. | Ministry, Agency Ministry of Industries, BCIC
02. | Procuring entity name Bangladesh Insulator & Sanitaryware Factory Ltd.(BISF)
03. | Procurement Method International Open Tendering Method (I10TM).
04. | Invitation for (brief description of goods) |i) 75 MT Calcined Bauxite.
ii) 25,600 Sets Ball & Socket Type Metallic Fittings for 10"
' Disc Insulator.
05. | Tender No. & date i) 36.091.007.04.50.1517.2016.0206, Dated 21/12/2016.
ii) 36.091.007.04.50.1943.2016.0207, Dated 21/12/2016.
06. | Eligibility of tenderers Genuine and bonafide Suppliers/Indentors/Manufacturers
having upto date related documents.
07.-| Price of tender document - i) Tk.500/- only, ii) Tk.600/- only.
08. | Amount of tender security i) Tk.50,000/- only, ii) Tk.80,000/- only,
09. | Sources of fund BISF own fund.
10. | Name & address of the offices of | i) Accounts Department, BISF Ltd., Bux Nagar, Mirpur, Dhaka-
selling tender document 1216. .
; ii) Controller of Accounts, BCIC, BCIC Bhaban, 30-31, Dilkusha
C/A., Dhaka-1000. A
iii) General Manager, BCIC Branch Office, 6, Agrabad C/A., Chittagong.
11. | Name & address of the office for Office of the General Manager (Commercial.), Purchase
submission of tender Section, BISF Ltd., Bux Nagar, Mirpur, Dhaka-1216.
“12. | Last date & time for selling tender 04/02/2017 (within office hour).
*| document
13. I;e;sctle;iate & time for submission of 05/02/2017. within 11.00 A.M.
14. | Date, time & place for opening of | 05/02/2016 at 11.30 P.M Purchase Section, BISF Ltd., Bux
tender Nagar, Mirpur, Dhaka-1216.
15. | Special instructions:
i) The procuring entity reserves the right to reject or accept all tenders prior to acceptance.
ii) If it is not possible to open the tender on due date due to unavoidable circumstances it will be
opend on the next working day.
iii) All actions in connection with this procurement will be performed as per Public Procurement
Rules-2008. ’ "
(A.Z. Tofail Ahmed)
Manager (Purchase)
For Managing Director.
E-mail : bisf.bcic@gmail.com

Circular-1.doc
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DAP FERTILIZER COMPANY LIMITED

(An Enterprise of Bangladesh Chemical Industries Corporation)
P.O.: CUFL, Rangadia, Chittagong-4000, Bangladesh.
Phone: 88-031-841210, Fax: 88-031-632389, E-mail: dapfclcom2006@gmail.com

INVITATION FOR INTERNATIONAL TENDER

1 | Ministry/Division Ministry of Industries.
2 | Agency Bangladesh Chemical Industries Corporation (BCIC)
3 | Purchaser Name DAP Fertilizer Company Ltd., Rangadia, Chittagong.
4 | Purchaser District Chittagong.
5 | SI. | Tender ref. no. Invitation for Earnest Last selling Closing date | Opening date
Procurement of Money date & time & time & time
01 DAPFCL/Com./FP- Low Tension BDT 30/01/2017 31/01/2017 | 31/01/2017
6.113/2016-17/856 (L.T.) Motor 2,00,000 | upto5:00 pm | at11:30am | at2:30 pm
dated: 12/12/2016.
02 DAPFCL/Com./FP- Weighing BDT 30/01/2017 31/01/2017 | 31/01/2017
5.101/2016-17/857 Controller 14,000 up to 5:00 pm | at 11:30 am at 2:30 pm
dated: 12/12/2016.
6 | Procurement Method International Open Tendering Method (I0TM).
7 | Budget and Source of Funds DAPFCL’s Own Source.
8 | Name & Address of the office(s) Address
- Selling Tender Document 1) Controller of Accounts, BCIC, BCIC Bhaban (6lh Floor),
30-31 Dilkusha C/A, Dhaka.
2) D.C. Office, Chittagong.
3) General Manager, BCIC Br. Office, 6, Agrabad C/A,
Chittagong.
4) Addl. Chief Accountant (A & F), DAP Fertilizer Co.
Ltd. Rangadia, Anowara, Chittagong.
- Receiving Tender Document 1) D.C. Office, Chittagong.
2) PWD, Division-1, Rahmatgonj, Chittagong.
3) General Manager (Comm.), DAP Fertilizer Co. Ltd.,
Rangadia, Anowara, Chittagong.
- Opening Tender Document General Manager (Comm.)
DAP Fertilizer Co. Ltd. Rangadia, Anowara, Chittagong.
9 | Price of Tender Document (Tk.) Tk. 500/- Per Set (Non-Refundable).
10 | Eligibility of Tenderer Necessary papers to be submitted complying the conditions
mentioned in the tender document.
11 | Name of Official Inviting Tender Managing Director, DAP Fertilizer Co. Ltd.,
CUFL, Rangadia, Chittagong. Phone: 88-031-2861210,
Fax: 88-031-632389.
12 | Special Instruction:

1) The Procuring Entity reserves the right to accept or reject any or all offers without assigning

any reason there of.

2) Due to unavoidable circumstances, if the tender can not be opened in the scheduled date & time,
Tender will be received & opened on the next working day in the same time.

s ,)1:/5 1/17’)‘}
(Swapan Kumar Datta)
General Manager (Civil) &
Head of Commercial Dept.
For Managing Director







Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board (BREB)
Invitation for Bids (IFB)
The People’s Republic of Bangladesh

Date: 21 December’2016

ADB Loan No.: Bangladesh Power System Enhancement and Efficiency Improvement Project.

IFB Title: Procurement of Conductor, Cable, Distribution Transformer & Sectionalizing Devices .

Package Number: URIDS (W)-G-02 & URIDS (W)-G-06.

Deadline for submission of Bids: 06.02.2017

Ref: 27.12.2637.064.07.01.16.536 Date:20.12.2016

The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board has applied financing from the Asian Development Bank (ADB) toward the cost of the
URIDS; RRKB (Up-gradation Rehabilitation and Intensification of Distribution System Rajshahi, Rangpur, Khulna and Barisal
Divisions) Project of BREB under Power Sector Enhancement and Efficiency Improvement of Bangladesh and intends to apply
part of the proceeds toward payments under the contracts for procurement of Conductor, Cable, Distribution Transformer &
Sectionalizing Devices .

2| The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board now invites sealed bids from eligible bidders. The Goods are grouped in different Packages
and Lots. Bidders have the option of submitting the Bids for one, any combination, or all of the lots. Lots shall not be further subdivideq
for bidding purposes. Goods to be delivered in designated BREB's Central Warehouse, Shiromoni, Khulna as follows:

—_

) : Delivery - -
AR antity - | Schedule from
Package No BREB Item 2o Lot NG ~{Nos./” ) " the date of -
: Sl Dt Sets/KM) | - contract
07 (Conductor, Bare) URIDS(W)-G-02-01 Conductor, Bare 17388 KM
08 (Conductor, Insulated -G-02-
( ) URIDS(W)-G-02-02 Conductor, Insulateq 17358 KM 50% of Unit of
IDS(W 11KV & 33KV Sub-Marine each Lot within
URIDS(W)-G-02 10 (Submarine & Underground Cable, 11KV & 33KV Under 20 weeks and
Cable) URIDS(W)-G-02-03 Ground Power Cable, 30 KM remaining
Termination Kits Straight 507
A o of each
Through Jointing Box etc. unit within 40
07 (Distribution Transformer)) | URIDS(W)-G-06-01 Distribution Transformer. 15812 NO weeks.
URIDS(W)-G-06 ks . Fuse Cutout, Fuse Barrel, Fuse
21 -G-06- ' s
(Sectionalizing Device) URIDS(W)-G-06-02 Link, Surge Arrester etc. 610600 NO

3 | International competitive bidding will be conducted in accordance with ADB’s Single-Stage: One-Envelope
procedure and is open to all bidders from eligible countries as described in the Bidding Document.

4 | Interested eligible bidders may obtain further information from The Project Director (e-mail:undsirkbbreb@gmail.com) and inspect
the bidding documents during office hours 09:00 AM to 17:00 PM (Except Friday & Saturday) at the address given below. Bidding

Document is also available at BREB's website i.e. http;//www.reb.gov.bd & htip://www.adb.org/countries/bangladesh/main
However the web version of the bidding document is for information purpose only.

5 | The Pre-Bid meeting shall be held at Conference Room of Chief Engineer (Project), 3 Floor, Head Office Building,
BREB on 17-01-2017 at 11:00 hours local time (Local Time: Bangladesh).
6 | Eligibility and Qualifications requirements: Manufacturer or supplier having the following qualifications:

(i) The Bidder (in case of 1V, each partner) shall demonstrate that the goods offered have been in production for at
least two years.




(i) Experiences: The Bidder shall | Package No Lot No 01 Contract Value | Liquid Asset
at-least have  experience  of {US$ Million) (US$ Million)
supplying similar goods having value URIDS(W)-G-02-01 6.70 2.70

in one contract, within the last . ey 5.30 2.14
three (3) years & at the time of bid URIDS(W)-G-02 | URIDS(W)-G-02-02

submission should have at least the ) URIDS(W)-G-02-03 1.30 0.53
amount of liquid asset or working URIDS(W)-G-06-01 5.60 2.20
capital or credit facility or their | URIDS(W)-G-06

combination mentioned against Lot: URIDS(W)-G-06-02 0-80 0.30

Additional details are provided in the Bidding Documents.

When comparing Bids, ADB’s Domestic Preference Scheme will be applied in accordance with the provisions stipulated in -

the bidding documents.

A complete set of each bidding documents in English may be purchased by interested eligible bidders upon the
submission of a written application to the address below and upon payment of a nonrefundable fee of equivalent
US$ 50. The method of payment will be Bank Draft or Pay Order in favor of Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board,
Dhaka. For overseas delivery, the bidder may obtain the bidding document by instructing any international courier
service to collect the same from Office of the Project Director, URIDS;RRKB Project, Bangladesh Rural Electrification
Board, 6™ Fioor, Head Office Building, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh,

Bidding Document last selling Date on 06-02-2017 at 10:00 Hours local time (Local Time: Bangladesh). Bids must be delivered to
the address stated at the end of this invitation on or before 06-02-2017 at 12:00 Noon local ime (local Time:Bangladesh) . Electronic
bidding will 770t be permitted. Late bids will be rejected. Bids wili be publidy opened in the presence of the bidders’ designated
representatives and anyone who chooses to attend at the Brig Gen. Sabihuddin Ahmed Hall (Auditorium), 1st floor, Head Office
Building, BREB, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh on 06-02-2017 at 12:30 Hours (Local Time: Bangladesh).

Package No Lot No Bid Security (US$ Million)
. . URIDS(W)-G-02-01 0.28
All bids must be accompanied URIDS(W)-G-02 URIDS(W)-G-02-02 0.22
by a Bid Security for individual
; - URIDS(W)-G-02-03 0.06
Lot are mentioned in the box.
URIDS(W)-G-06 URIDS(W)-G-06-01 0.22
URIDS(W)-G-06-02 0.03

In case, amount is in any currency other than USD, a selling exchange rate issued by Bangladesh Bank, 28 days prior to bid
submission shall be used. Bidders participating in multiple Lot shall submit bid security for each Lot separately.

The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board Will not be responsible for any cost or expenses incurred in connection with
the preparation or delivery of Bids.

Project Director, URIDS;RRKB Project,
Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board,
 Fioor, Head Office Building,

JREA AF e @6 Nikunja-2, Khilkhet,

BANGLADESH RURAL ELECTRIFICATION BOARD City: Dhaka-1229, Country: Bangladesh.

) Tel: + 8802- 8900309
(IS0 Standard : 5001-2008) E-mail: uridsrrkbbreb@gmail.com

-__\_'?__.D_s_ﬁa.b_) R03Y-059 Web site: www.reb.gov.bd.

XK 207 -




Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board (BREB)
Invitation for Bids (IFB)
The People’s Republic of Bangladesh

Date:21 December 2016

ADB Loan No.: Bangladesh Power System Enhancement and Efficiency Improvement Project.

IFB Title: Procurement of Conductor, Distribution Transformer & Sectionalizing Devices.

Package Number: URIDS(E)-G-02 & URIDS(E)-G-06.

Deadline for submission of Bids: 06.02.2017

Ref: 27.12.2637.125.31.031.197.16.529 Date: 19.12.2016

The Bangladesh Rural Eledrification Board has applied finandng from the Asian Development Bank (ADB) toward the cost of the URIDS;
DMCS (Up-gradation Rehabilitation and intensification of Distribution System Dhaka, Mymensingh, Chittagong and Sylhet Divisions)
Project of BREB under Power Sector Enhancernent and Effidency Improvement of Bangladesh and intends to apply part of the proceeds
toward payments under the contracts for procurement of Conductor, Distribution Transformer & Sectionalizing Devices.

The Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board now invites sealed bids from eligible bidders. The Goods are grouped in different Packages
and Lots. Bidders have the option of submitting the Bids for one, any combination, or all of the lots. Lots shall not be further
subdivided for bnddung purposes Goods to be dellvered in d&ﬂgnated BREB's warehouses (Dhaka Khulna & Chuttagong) as follows:

Delivery Scheduile.

—

N

Package No BREB Item (Nos)

Lot No

Bnef Descrlptlon 'of Goods

gy

- from the date tf

URIDS(E)*(:—OZ-OI

ACSR, Bare Conductor

24262 KM

URIDS(E)-G-02 19 {Conductor)

URIDS(E)-G-02-02

Insulated Conductor

17695 KM

URIDS(E)-G-02-03

11 833 KV Underground & Submarine
Gable with kits & Joning Boes.

36 KM with 300 nos. kits
& 150 nos. Joining Box

URIDS(E)-G-06 07 (Distribution Transformer)

URIDS(E)-G-06-01

Distribution Transformer

18545 Nos.

21 (Sectionalizing Devices)

URIDS(E)-G-06-02

Fuse Cutout & Surge Arresbey; Fuse ink

1095300 Nos.

50% of Unit of
each Lot within
20 weeks and

remaining 50%
of each unit

+| within 40 weseks.

3 | International competitive bidding will be conducted in accordance with ADB’s Single-Stage: One-Envelope
procedure and is open to all bidders from eligible countries as described in the Bidding Document. )
Interested eligible bidders may obtain further information from The Project Director (e-mail: pdrids42breb@gmail.com) and inspect the
bidding documents during office hours 09:00 AM to 17:00 PM (Except Friday & Saturday) at the address given below. Bidding Document is
also available at BREB's website i.e. http://www.reb.gov.bd & h 'www.adb.org/coun bangladesh/main However the web version of
the bidding document is for information purpose only.
The Pre-Bid meeting shall be held at Conference Room of Chief Engineer (Praject, 3rd Floor, H/Q Building),
on 17-01-2017 at 11:00 hours local time (Local Time: Bangladesh)
Eligibility and Qualifications requirements: Manufacturer or supplier having the following qualifications:

(i) The Bidder (in case of JV, each partner) shall demonstrate that the goods offered have been in praduction for at least two years.

(ii) Experiences: The Bidder shall at-least Package No Lot No 01 Contract Value Liquid Asset
have experience of supplying similar (US$ Million) (US$ Million)
goods having value in one contract, 7.68 3.6
within the last three (3) years & at the 564
time of bid submission shquld have at 156
least the amount of liquid asset or =1
working capital or credit facility or their 6.0
combination mentioned against Lot: 10

Additional details are provided in the Bidding Documents.
When comparing Bids, ADB's Domestic Preference Scheme will be applied in accordance with the provisions stipulated in the bidding documents,
A complete set of each bidding documents in English may be purchased by interested eligible bidders upon the submission of a written
application to the address below and upon payment of a nonrefundable fee of equivalent US$ 50. The method of payment will be
Bank Draft or Pay Order in favor of Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board, Dhaka. For overseas delivery, the bidder may obtain the
bidding document by instructing any international courier service to collect the same from Office of the Project Director, URIDS; DMCS
Project, Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board, 4™ Floor, Training Academy Building, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh.
Bidding Document last selling Date on 06-02-2017 at 11:00 Hours local time (Local Time: Bangladesh). Bids must be delivered
to the address stated at the end of this invitation on or before 06-02-2017 at 12:00 Noon (local time: Bangladesh) . Electronic
bidding will not be permitted. Late bids will be rejected. Bids will be publidy opened in the presence of the bidders’ designated
representatives and anyone who chooses to attend at the Brig Gen. Sabihuddin Ahmed Hall (Auditorium), 1st floor, Head Office
Building, BREB, Nikunja-2, Khilkhet, Dhaka-1229, Bangladesh on 06-02-2017 at 12:30 Hours (Local Time: Bangladesh).
Package No Lot No Bid Security (US$ Million
URIDS(E)-G-02-01 0.3
URIDS(E)-G-02-02 o 0.2

_0.05

4

URIDS(E)-G-02-01
URIDS(E)-G-02-02
URIDS(E)-G-02-03
URIDS(E)-G-06-01
URIDS(E)-G-06-02

URIDS(E)-G-02

URIDS(E)-G-06

All bids must be accompanied by e

a Bid Security for individual Lot URIDS(E}-G-02 | URIDS(E)-G-02.03

are mantioned in the box. e w--—(—)-mv-—- e Rt
URIDS(E)-G-06- 02

URIDS(E) -G06 |

In case, amount is in any currency other than USD, a selling exchange rate issued by Bangladesh Bank, 28 days pruor to bld

The Bangladegh_thal Electrification Board Will not be responsible for any cost or expenses incurred in connection with
the preparation or delivery of Bids.

Project Director, URIDS;DMCS Project,
Bangladesh Rural Electrification Board,
4™ Floor, Training Academy Building,
Nikunja-2, Khilkhet,

City: Dhaka-1229, Country: Bangladesh.
Tel: + 8802- 8900757

E-mail: pdrids42breb@gmail.com

Web site: www.reb.gov.bd.

JrATA g [y @6

BANGLADESH RURAL ELECTRIFICATION BOARD
(ISO Standard : 9001-2008)
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